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Good Governance or Bad Governance? 
 

 
The prime minister owns one of the 
country’s largest TV networks and a 
national newspaper 

 
 
A poor country 

 
Fair and free elections are held 
every four years 

 
An independent media that can 
question decision-making or expose 
wrongdoing 

Shareholders of transnationals 
demand that companies meet 
international standards of business 
practice wherever they operate 

 
Ordinary people can see 
government budget accounts on 
request 

 
A large amount of government 
money is in bank accounts overseas 

 
 
A rich country 

 
 
A fair legal system and police force 

Transnational companies take 
advantage of loose regulations over 
working conditions and 
environmental protection 

 
The President leaves office to one 
of his two sons 

 
Government officials work with 
local communities on development 
projects 

 
The country is at risk from 
terrorist attacks 

 
Pressure is placed on ordinary 
people to vote in a particular way 
during an election campaign 

 
Government officials sit on the 
board of directors of major 
companies operating in the country 

 
Many people are held in jails 
without charge 

 




